
Infrastructure (Driver and Vehicle Standards – 2023 Fees) (Jersey) Order 2022 Contents 

 

 

 
   R&O.102/2022 Page - 1 

 

 
INFRASTRUCTURE (DRIVER AND VEHICLE 

STANDARDS – 2023 FEES) (JERSEY) ORDER 2022 

Contents 

Article 

1 Motor Cars (Driving Instruction) (Jersey) Order 1982 amended .................... 3 
2 Motor Vehicle Registration (General Provisions) (Jersey) Order 1993 

amended ......................................................................................................... 3 
3 Motor Vehicles (Construction and Use) (Jersey) Order 1998 amended ........ 4 
4 Motor Vehicles (Driving Licences) (Jersey) Order 2003 amended ................. 4 
5 Motor Traffic (Public Service Vehicles) (Fees) (Jersey) Order 2008 amended 5 
6 Road Traffic (Periodic Technical Inspections – Fees) (Jersey) Order 2019 

amended ......................................................................................................... 5 
7 Citation and commencement ......................................................................... 5 
 





Infrastructure (Driver and Vehicle Standards – 2023 Fees) (Jersey) Order 2022 Article 1 

 

 

 
   R&O.102/2022 Page - 3 

 

 
INFRASTRUCTURE (DRIVER AND VEHICLE 

STANDARDS – 2023 FEES) (JERSEY) ORDER 2022 

Made 29th November 2022 

Coming into force 1st January 2023 

THE MINISTER FOR INFRASTRUCTURE makes this Order under 

Articles 8, 29, and 46 of the Motor Traffic (Jersey) Law 1935, Articles 4, 7, 8, 

10 and 16 of the Motor Vehicle Registration (Jersey) Law 1993, and Articles 6, 

7, 8, 77, 78, 78A and 84 of the Road Traffic (Jersey) Law 1956 – 

1 Motor Cars (Driving Instruction) (Jersey) Order 1982 amended 

In Article 7 (fees) of the Motor Cars (Driving Instruction) (Jersey) Order 1982 – 

(a) in paragraphs (1) and (2), for “£106.50” there is substituted 

“£109.50”; 

(b) in paragraphs (3) and (4), for “£215.00” there is substituted 

“£220.50”. 

2 Motor Vehicle Registration (General Provisions) (Jersey) Order 1993 
amended 

In the Motor Vehicle Registration (General Provisions) (Jersey) Order 1993, in 

the provisions listed in column 1 of the following table, for the figure specified 

in the corresponding entry in column 2 there is substituted the figure specified in 

the corresponding entry in column 3 – 

 

Column 1 Column 2 Column 3 

Article 5(1)(b)(iii) £32.50 £33.50 

Article 17(1) £17.00 £17.50 

Article 24(1)(b) £39.50 £40.50 

Article 33(2) £5 £5.10 

Schedule 2 paragraph 4(a) £457.00 £460.00 

Schedule 2 paragraph 4(a) £127.00 £130.00 

Schedule 2 paragraph 5 £101.00 £103.50 

https://www.jerseylaw.je/laws/current/Pages/25.200.aspx
https://www.jerseylaw.je/laws/current/Pages/25.350.aspx
https://www.jerseylaw.je/laws/current/Pages/25.550.aspx
https://www.jerseylaw.je/laws/current/Pages/25.550.04.aspx
https://www.jerseylaw.je/laws/current/Pages/25.550.04.aspx
https://www.jerseylaw.je/laws/current/Pages/25.350.50.aspx
https://www.jerseylaw.je/laws/current/Pages/25.350.50.aspx


Article 3 Infrastructure (Driver and Vehicle Standards – 2023 Fees) (Jersey) Order 2022 

 

 

Page - 4    R&O.102/2022 
 

 

Schedule 2 paragraph 6(2)(a) £39.50 £40.50 

Schedule 4A paragraph 2(2)(b) £99.00 £101.50 

Schedule 4A paragraph 4(2)(a) £99.00 £101.50 

Schedule 4A paragraph 4(2)(b) £114.50 £117.50 

Schedule 4A paragraph 4(5) £99.00 £101.50. 

3 Motor Vehicles (Construction and Use) (Jersey) Order 1998 amended 

In the Motor Vehicles (Construction and Use) (Jersey) Order 1998 – 

(a) in Article 2(7) (application and exemptions) –  

(i) in sub-paragraph (a), for “£105.50” there is substituted 

“£108.20”, 

(ii) in sub-paragraph (b), for “£192” there is substituted 

“£196.80”, 

(iii) in sub-paragraph (c), for “£96” there is substituted “£98.40”; 

(b) in Article 120(1B) (power to require certificates of compliance) for 

“£192” there is substituted “£196.80”. 

4 Motor Vehicles (Driving Licences) (Jersey) Order 2003 amended 

In the table in Schedule 3 (fees) to the Motor Vehicles (Driving Licences) (Jersey) 

Order 2003, from “Prescribed test” to the end of the table there is substituted – 

 

“Prescribed test 

Compulsory basic training course (and giving of compulsory 

basic training certificate if successful) £145.50 

Duplicate copy of compulsory basic training certificate £12.00 

Off road theory test other than in respect of category C and D 

vehicles £38.50 

Off road theory test in respect of category C and D vehicles £47.00 

On road practical test other than in respect of category A1, P, C 

and D vehicles or, in respect of category A, where a person is 

not required under Article 24(4)(e) to produce a compulsory 

basic training certificate to the examiner immediately before 

taking the test £56.50 

On road practical test in respect of category C and D vehicles £106.50 

On road practical test in respect of category A1 and P vehicles 

or, in respect of category A, where a person is required under 

Article 24(4)(e) to produce a compulsory basic training 

certificate to the examiner immediately before taking the test £49.00 

Duplicate copy of certificate or statement in respect of result of 

theory test or practical test £12.00”. 

https://www.jerseylaw.je/laws/current/Pages/25.550.08.aspx
https://www.jerseylaw.je/laws/current/Pages/25.550.08.aspx
https://www.jerseylaw.je/laws/current/Pages/25.550.10.aspx
https://www.jerseylaw.je/laws/current/Pages/25.550.10.aspx
https://www.jerseylaw.je/laws/current/Pages/25.550.10.aspx


Infrastructure (Driver and Vehicle Standards – 2023 Fees) (Jersey) Order 2022 Article 5 

 

 

 
   R&O.102/2022 Page - 5 

 

5 Motor Traffic (Public Service Vehicles) (Fees) (Jersey) Order 2008 
amended 

In Article 2 (fees payable under the Law) of the Motor Traffic (Public Service 

Vehicles) (Fees) (Jersey) Order 2008 – 

(a) in paragraph (1), for “£164.00” there is substituted “£168.00”; 

(b) in paragraph (2), for “£82.00” there is substituted “£84.00”; 

(c) in paragraph (5) – 

(i) in sub-paragraph (b), for “£103.50” there is substituted 

“£106.50”,  

(ii) in sub-paragraph (c), for “£82.00” there is substituted 

“£84.00”, 

(iii) in sub-paragraph (d), for “£55.00” there is substituted 

“£56.50”.  

6 Road Traffic (Periodic Technical Inspections – Fees) (Jersey) Order 2019 
amended 

In Article 1(1) (fees for inspections) of the Road Traffic (Periodic Technical 

Inspections – Fees) (Jersey) Order 2019 – 

(a) in sub-paragraph (a), for “£30” there is substituted “£31.00”; 

(b) in sub-paragraph (b), for “£90” there is substituted “£93.00”. 

7 Citation and commencement 

This Order may be cited as the Infrastructure (Driver and Vehicle Standards – 

2023 Fees) (Jersey) Order 2022 and comes into force on 1st January 2023. 

DEPUTY T.J.A. BINET OF ST. SAVIOUR 

Minister for Infrastructure 

 

https://www.jerseylaw.je/laws/current/Pages/25.200.60.aspx
https://www.jerseylaw.je/laws/current/Pages/25.200.60.aspx
https://www.jerseylaw.je/laws/current/Pages/25.200.60.aspx
https://www.jerseylaw.je/laws/current/Pages/25.550.33.aspx
https://www.jerseylaw.je/laws/current/Pages/25.550.33.aspx
https://www.jerseylaw.je/laws/current/Pages/25.550.33.aspx

