Motor Cars (Driving Instruction) (Amendment No. 14) (Jersey)
Order 2003 Article 1

=
=
xﬁé’i
Jersey

R&O - 116/2003

MOTOR CARS (DRIVING INSTRUCTION)
(AMENDMENT No. 14) (JERSEY) ORDER 2003

Made 30th October 2003

Coming into force 1st January 2004

THE HOME AFFAIRS COMMITTEE, in pursuance of Articles 3B, 3C and
42 of the Road Traffic (Jersey) Law 1956, orders as follows —

1 Amendments
In Article 7 of the Motor Cars (Driving Instruction) (Jersey) Order 19822 —

(@  in paragraph (1), for the expression “£67.75” there shall be substituted the
expression “£69.40”;

(b)  in paragraph (2), for the expression “£67.75” there shall be substituted the
expression “£69.40”;

(c) in paragraph (3), for the expression “£134.45” there shall be substituted
the expression “£137.80”;

(d) in paragraph (4), for the expression “£134.45” there shall be substituted
the expression “£137.80.

2 Revocation of previous amendment

The Motor Cars (Driving Instruction) (Amendment No. 13) (Jersey) Order
20023 shall be revoked.

3 Citation and commencement

This Order may be cited as the Motor Cars (Driving Instruction) (Amendment
No. 14) (Jersey) Order 2003 and shall come into force on 1st January 2004.

M.N. DE LA HAYE
Greffier of the States.

Price code: A
R&O —116/2003



Motor Cars (Driving Instruction) (Amendment No. 14) (Jersey)
Article 3 Order 2003

R&O — 116/2003



Motor Cars (Driving Instruction) (Amendment No. 14) (Jersey)
Order 2003 Endnotes

L Recueil des Lois, Tome VIII, pages 587 and 633 and Nos. 7020, 7917 and 9294.
2 Nos. 7028 and 142/2002.
3 No. 142/2002.




