
Economic Development (2016 Fees) (Jersey) Order 2015 Arrangement 

 

 
 

Price code: B Page - 1 

R&O.172/2015 
 

 
ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT (2016 FEES) 

(JERSEY) ORDER 2015 

Arrangement 

Article 

1 Sea Fisheries (General Fees) (Jersey) Order 2010 amended .......................... 3 
2 Shipping (Fees) (Jersey) Order 2013 amended ............................................... 3 
3 Weights and Measures (Testing Fees) (Jersey) Order 2003 amended ............ 7 
4 Tourism (General Provisions) (Jersey) Order 1990 amended ........................ 8 
5 Places of Refreshment (Registration) (Fees) (Jersey) Order 2008 

amended .......................................................................................................... 9 
6 Citation and commencement........................................................................... 9 

 

 





Economic Development (2016 Fees) (Jersey) Order 2015 Article 1 

 

 
 

 Page - 3 

R&O.172/2015 
 

 
ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT (2016 FEES) 

(JERSEY) ORDER 2015 

Made 23rd December 2015 

Coming into force in accordance with Article 6 

THE MINISTER FOR ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT, in pursuance of 

Regulation 7 of the Sea Fisheries (Licensing of Fishing Boats) (Jersey) 

Regulations 20031, Regulation 3 of the Sea Fisheries (Underwater Fishing) 

(Jersey) Regulations 20032, Regulations 2 and 5 of the Sea Fisheries (Fisheries) 

(Jersey) Regulations 20103, Articles 193 and 196 of the Shipping (Jersey) 

Law 20024, Articles 12 and 38 of the Weights and Measures (Jersey) 

Law 19675, Articles 9 and 32 of the Tourism (Jersey) Law 19486, and Articles 4 

and 14 of the Places of Refreshment (Jersey) Law 19677, orders as follows – 

1 Sea Fisheries (General Fees) (Jersey) Order 2010 amended 

In the Sea Fisheries (General Fees) (Jersey) Order 20108 – 

(a) in Article 1 for the amount “£96.65” there is substituted the amount 

“£99.06”; 

(b) in Article 2(a) for the amount “£85.00” there is substituted the amount 

“£87.12”; 

(c) in Article 2(b) for the amount “£17.70” there is substituted the amount 

“£18.14”; 

(d) in Article 3(1) for the amount “£175.94” there is substituted the amount 

“£180.33”; 

(e) in Article 3(2)(a)(i) for the amount “£175.94” there is substituted the 

amount “£180.33”; 

(f) in Article 3(2)(a)(ii) for the amount “£26.68” there is substituted the 

amount “£27.34”. 

2 Shipping (Fees) (Jersey) Order 2013 amended 

For the table in the Schedule to the Shipping (Fees) (Jersey) Order 20139 there 

shall be substituted the following table – 



Article 2 Economic Development (2016 Fees) (Jersey) Order 2015 

 

 
Page - 4  

 R&O.172/2015 
 

“1 

Enactment and provision 

(Article or Regulation) 

2 

Action 

3 

Fee 

Shipping (Registration) (Jersey) Regulations 200410 

3(7) Issue of transcript £50 

6(7) Notification of change of representative person £50 

7(1)(b) Application for full registration of ship – 

(a) if the ship is a pleasure vessel of 

150 gross tons or less and the owner of 

the ship is an individual ordinarily 

resident in Jersey or a body corporate 

established under Jersey law 

 

(a) 

£340 

 

 (b) in any other case (b) 

£440 

7(1)(b) Application for simple registration of fishing 

vessel (as referred to in Regulation 7(12)(b)) 

£55 

8 Provisional registration £125 

9(2) Where declaration of intent is made to 

accompany application for registration, 

additional fee 

£50 

17(3)(c) Application for renewal of registration £100 

18(8) Application to register transfer of ownership £125 

19(7)(c) Application to register transmission in 

ownership 

£125 

20(3)(c) Application to record change in particulars  £50 

21(3)(b) Application to record change of name £50 

23(1)(a) Cancellation of registration, where on owner’s 

application 

£50 

23(2)(a) Issue of closure transcript on request £50 

24(4) Registration of mortgage £125 

24(5) Registration of discharge of mortgage £125 

25(2) Registration of priority notice of intending 

mortgagee 

£50 

25(10)(b) Renewal of registration of priority notice £25 

26(5) Registration of transfer or transmission of 

mortgage 

£125 

30(1) Issue of duplicate certificate £50 



Economic Development (2016 Fees) (Jersey) Order 2015 Article 2 

 

 
 

 Page - 5 

R&O.172/2015 
 

“1 

Enactment and provision 

(Article or Regulation) 

2 

Action 

3 

Fee 

31(1)(a) Transfer within the register £352 

Shipping (Local Small Ships Registration) (Jersey) Regulations 200411 

2(2)(b) Application for registration £60 

2(8)(b) Application for extension £60 

5(1) Issue of duplicate certificate £30 

2(2)(b), 2(8)(b) or 5(1) Registration, extension or issue, where 

requested to be done within 24 hours and so 

done, instead of relevant fee prescribed above 

£125 

Shipping (Tonnage) (Jersey) Regulations 200412 

3(1) Measurement of ship (24m in length or over)  £85 

per 

hour  

8(1) Issue of International Tonnage Certificate 

(ship 24m in length or over) 

£27 

11(5) Issue of new International Tonnage Certificate 

(ship 24m in length or over) 

£30 

13 Measurement of fishing vessel (15m in length 

or over but less than 24m)  

£85 

per 

hour  

15 Issue of certificate (fishing vessel 15m in 

length or over but less than 24m) 

£15 

18 Measurement of ship (less than 24m in length) 

other than fishing vessel or of fishing vessel 

(less than 15m in length)  

£85 

per 

hour  

22(5) Issue of certificate (ship less than 24m in 

length other than fishing vessel)  

£30 

22(5) Issue of certificate (fishing vessel less than 

15m in length)  

£30 

24(1) Issue of International Tonnage Certificate 

(non-Jersey ship) 

£30 

Shipping (Fishing Vessels Safety Codes of Practice) (Jersey) Regulations 201513 

3(1)(a) Issue of fishing vessel certificate £50 

3(1)(b) Examination of vessel £54 



Article 2 Economic Development (2016 Fees) (Jersey) Order 2015 

 

 
Page - 6  

 R&O.172/2015 
 

“1 

Enactment and provision 

(Article or Regulation) 

2 

Action 

3 

Fee 

3(1)(b) Annual examination – vessels of 15 metres or 

more overall in length 

£100 

3(2) Grant of exemption £60 

3(3) Extension of certificate or exemption £60 

3(4) Acceptance of equivalent certificate £60 

Shipping (Load Line) (Jersey) Regulations 200414 

8 Initial survey and renewal and subsequent 

annual surveys 

£85 

per 

hour 

9(1) Issue of certificate £70 

18(1) Issue of international load line exemption 

certificate 

£25 

19(1) Issue of Jersey load line exemption certificate £25 

Shipping (Training, Certification and Manning) (Jersey) Order 200415 

Regulation 5 of the UK 

Manning Regulations  

Issue of safe manning document £215 

 Issue of written exemption £70 

Shipping (Safety of Navigation) (Jersey) Order 200916 

6(1) Consideration of grant of approval under 

SOLAS regulation 

£85 

per 

hour 

6(3) Issue, alteration or cancellation of written 

approval 

£70 

7(1) Consideration of exemption or equivalence £85 

per 

hour 

7(2) Issue of written exemption or equivalence £70 

Shipping (Survey and Certification) (Jersey) Order 201317 

Regulation 4 of the UK 1995 

Regulations 

Survey of passenger ship £85 

per 

hour 

Regulation 4A of the 

UK 1995 Regulations 

Survey of Jersey passenger ship to which the 

Directive applies 

£85 

per 

hour 



Economic Development (2016 Fees) (Jersey) Order 2015 Article 3 

 

 
 

 Page - 7 

R&O.172/2015 
 

“1 

Enactment and provision 

(Article or Regulation) 

2 

Action 

3 

Fee 

Regulation 7 of the UK 1995 

Regulations 

Survey of cargo ship structure etc. £85 

per 

hour 

Regulations 10, 11, 13, 

14, 17(1) or 18 of the 

UK 1995 Regulations 

Issue of certificate £70 

Shipping (Safety Code – Yachts and Small Ships) (Jersey) Regulations 201318 

3(3) Grant of exemption £70 

3(4) Acceptance of equivalent provision etc. £85 

per 

hour 

4(1) Examination of vessel  £85 

per 

hour  

4(1) Issue of certificate £70 

4(2) Recognition of equivalent certificate £70”. 

3 Weights and Measures (Testing Fees) (Jersey) Order 2003 amended 

For the Schedule to the Weights and Measures (Testing Fees) (Jersey) 

Order 200319 there is substituted the following Schedule – 

 

“SCHEDULE 

(Article 2) 

FEE FOR TESTING WEIGHING OR MEASURING EQUIPMENT FOR 

PASSING FOR USE FOR TRADE 

1 Linear measures 

 (a) not exceeding 3m, per measure £7.19 

 (b) exceeding 3m, per measure £19.67 

2 Capacity measures 

 (a) per measure, when submitted in quantities of less than 

100 

£1.93 



Article 4 Economic Development (2016 Fees) (Jersey) Order 2015 

 

 
Page - 8  

 R&O.172/2015 
 

 (b) per measure, when submitted in quantities of 100 or 

more 

£0.28 

3 Measuring instruments for measuring liquid fuel or lubricants 

 (a) container types, unsubdivided, per instrument £28.87 

 (b) single outlet types, per instrument £52.39 

 (c) multi-outlet types, for meters at a single site submitted on 

the same occasion – 

 

  (i) first meter £31.98 

  (ii) per additional meter £31.98 

4 Measuring instruments for measuring intoxicating liquor 

 per instrument £7.98 

5 Weights 

 (a) per weight, when submitted in quantities of less than 20 £2.61 

 (b) per weight, when submitted in quantities of 20 or more £1.30 

6 Weighing instruments 

 (a) per instrument calibrated to weigh only in metric or 

imperial units, having a capacity marked on the 

instrument – 

 

  (i) not exceeding 15kg (or 34lb) £19.67 

  (ii) exceeding 15kg but not exceeding 250kg 

(or exceeding 34lb but not exceeding 550lb) 

£26.24 

  (iii) exceeding 250kg but not exceeding 1000kg 

(or exceeding 550lb but not exceeding 2204lb) 

£52.39 

  (iv) exceeding 1000kg (or 2204lb) £274.24 

 (b) per instrument calibrated to weigh in metric and imperial 

units a fee of 150% of the fee that would be payable 

under sub-paragraph (a) if the instrument were calibrated 

to weigh only in metric or in imperial units.”. 

 

4 Tourism (General Provisions) (Jersey) Order 1990 amended 

For Schedule 1 to the Tourism (General Provisions) (Jersey) Order 199020 there 

is substituted the following Schedule – 



Economic Development (2016 Fees) (Jersey) Order 2015 Article 5 

 

 
 

 Page - 9 

R&O.172/2015 
 

“SCHEDULE 1 

(Article 21) 

FEES FOR REGISTRATION OR RENEWAL OF REGISTRATION 

Class of registration Amount of fee 

1. Hotel Register £7.12 multiplied by the number of persons 

who can be lodged on the premises 

2. Guest House Register £4.74 multiplied by the number of persons 

who can be lodged on the premises 

3. Self-Catering Accommodation 

Register 

£6.61 multiplied by the number of persons 

who can be lodged on the premises 

4. Youth Hostel Register £3.98 multiplied by the number of persons 

who can be lodged on the premises 

5. Holiday Camp Register £4.99 multiplied by the number of persons 

who can be lodged on the premises 

6. Camp Site Register £3.98 multiplied by the number of persons 

who can be lodged on the premises.”. 

5 Places of Refreshment (Registration) (Fees) (Jersey) Order 2008 amended 

In Article 1 of the Places of Refreshment (Registration) (Fees) (Jersey) 

Order 200821, for the figure “£88.00” there is substituted the figure “£88.88”. 

6 Citation and commencement 

(1) This Order may be cited as the Economic Development (2016 Fees) 

(Jersey) Order 2015. 

(2) Article 4 of this Order shall come into force 7 days after the day this 

Order is made. 

(3) The remainder of this Order shall come into force on 1st January 2016. 

SENATOR L.J. FARNHAM 

Minister for Economic Development 

 



Endnotes Economic Development (2016 Fees) (Jersey) Order 2015 

 

 
Page - 10  

 R&O.172/2015 
 

 

                                                      
1  chapter 14.825.56 
2  chapter 14.825.94 
3  chapter 14.825.24 
4  chapter 19.885 
5  chapter 05.925 
6  chapter 05.850 
7  chapter 11.600 
8  chapter 14.825.28 
9  chapter 19.885.20 
10  chapter 19.885.70 
11  chapter 19.885.60 
12  chapter 19.885.80 
13  R&O.42/2015 
14  chapter 19.885.50 
15  chapter 19.885.90 
16  chapter 19.885.73 
17  chapter 19.885.77 
18  chapter 19.885.72 
19  chapter 05.925.75 
20  chapter 05.850.50 
21  chapter 11.600.30 


